11/8/2017 LexisNexis Payment Solutions - Notification of Payment

From: DoNotReply <DoNotReply@VitalChek.com>
To: GWW1210 <GWW1210@AOL.COM>
Subject: LexisNexis Payment Solutions - Notification of Payment
Date: Wed, Nov 8,2017 1:35 pm

Cook Co District 1 - Civil Division

Payment Date: 11/8/2017
Payment Status: AUTHORIZED
Confirmation Number: 72922329
Payment Method: Credit Card
Number: ******xxx*x*(0256

Bill To: GORDON WATTS
821 ALICIA RD

Lakeland, FL 33801 US

Product: Civil Division Fees/Costs (8616)
Case #: 2017-M1-400775
Amount : $12.50

Agency Amount: $ 12.50
LexisNexis Service Fee: $ 0.26
Total Amount: $ 12.76

Your payment was made through Phone.

For business or technical support, please send an email to paymentsolutions(@lexisnexis.com

LexisNexis Payment Solutions
LexisNexis VitalChek Network Inc.

---------------------------------------- The information contained in this e-mail message is intended only for the
personal and confidential use of the recipient(s) named above. This message may be an attorney-client
communication and/or work product and as such is privileged and confidential. If the reader of this message is
not the mtended recipient or an agent responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that you have received this document in error and that any review, dissemmation, distribution, or copying
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of'this message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify us
mmediately by e-mail, and delete the original message.
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